
May. 9, 2021 Sunday Worship Pulpit Message

The Gospel Prevails. <Luke 10:1-20>

You are holding to the covenant as you give worship to God. 
Then, all the force of darkness will be bound. All the problems 
you face must crumble. Worship is also a spiritual battle. 
Worship is a mission that God has given to us. And you must 
stake your life to worship. There are times when you face the 
problem that there is nothing you can do. That is when true 
worship will arise. Today, the word that God has given to us 
is that “The Gospel will prevail.” Do you believe in this? The 
Gospel prevails. And it is nothing else, but Gospel will prevail. 
And it is the conclusion of the Bible for those who hold onto 
only the Gospel will have no choice but to prevail. God is 
looking for hose individuals. That is why you must give 
worship with that heart and the covenant. If you continue to 
do so, then God will be at work. That is when God will live 
for your behalf. If you live by the Gospel, you will prevail. If 
not, you will be enslaved. For you to be set free means that 
you can conquer with the Gospel. If you are enslaved, that 
means you have no choice but to wrestle within your life 
through conflicts. That means your heart is somewhere else. 
Once again, you must be able to confirm of this truth and be 
able to be placed the covenant of Christ within your heart. 
And you must give the worship with the covenant. It must be 
the covenantal worship. And the Gospel is the content of your 
prayer. And if you are praying holding onto the different 
prayer topic, that means you are being deceived. The Gospel 
must be your prayer. It is Matthew 6:33 in which you can 
conclude with that prayer alone. It is the promise of Matt 
6:33, if you just pray holding onto my promise, I will give 
you everything to you. It is a prayer in which you must be 
able to enjoy the Gospel and God who is with you. Not only 
God will give them answers but also God will trust his works 
to them. For example, if there is a CEO of a company, and 
he has many sons, then who would be entrusted with the 
company? Would he entrust a company to a son that 
complains and nags at his Father to given him the company? 
No, he will not. He will entrust the company to those who 
know his heart and continue his company. The father would 
not give his renowned company to a son who has no interest 
and who has not been prepared. It is same for our prayers as 
well. Do I truly connect with God’s heart? Am I truly 
prepared to do what God desires? That is the work that you 
must do. You must enjoy Christ to connect with God’s heart. 
The Gospel is God’s heart. When you enjoy the Gospel, then 
naturally, you will be able to connect with God’s heart. You 
will be able to know His desire and His will. Not only that, 
but you will also be able to live the life that is within that. 
That is how you will become a person who connects with 
God’s heart. For those who are like this will never wrestle 
with God. When you continuously enjoy this Gospel, you will 
be the one that continuously connects with God. Then, there is 
no other prayer that is needed. You will just be in 
thanksgiving of God and can enjoy that He is with you. That 
is why the Gospel is the solution to all problems and the 
Gospel is of Christ. That is why we must genuinely enjoy the 
Gospel. You must go into the depth of Gospel. Go into the 
depth of prayer to enjoy the Gospel. Then, it contains all 
things that you need. 

1. The Gospel Prevails. 

The first point we will look at is “The Gospel Prevails.” And 
surely it will prevail. The Gospel prevails, that is why 
evangelism will prevail. In verse 1, it says, “The LORD 
appointed 72 others and sent them on ahead of him, 2 by 2, 
into every town and place where he himself was about to go.” 
They are particularly important figures. They were the one who 
were responsible of evangelizing within the region. And they 
were the one who held onto God’s commission of evangelism 
at that time. There was a deacon, Phillip. He was able to 
testify this Gospel even to Africa, to the Ethiopian tribes, and 
Samaria. Even Ethiopia, itself, is the nation which God has 
used to testify this Gospel in Africa. And there was a deacon, 
Stephan who was murdered at that time. And of course, 
Antioch church was important church. He became the spiritual 
basic of the foundation within that church. Even at that time, 
there were severe persecution. When the LORD sent His people 
out to the field, He sent them with powers so that they were 
able to overcome the persecution that comes to them. We all 
know verse 19 well. It says, “I have given you authority to 
trample on snakes and scorpions and to overcome all the 
power of the enemy; Nothing will harm you.” And in verse 
18, it says, “I saw Satan fall from heaven like lightning!” 
Because all the forces of darkness are being crumbled because 
the Gospel has been testified, Satan is in urgent matter. This is 
the authority of the Gospel that God has given to you. When 
the Gospel is testified, Satan’s kingdom has no choice cut to 
crumble. You must believe in this covenant. This is the 
authority of Christ and the Gospel God has given to you. The 
Gospel will surely prevail. There is nowhere else for you to go 
or do anything else. Regardless of the problem, you will be 
able to overcome all with the Gospel. The Gospel alone will 
be able to resolve all problems you face. That is the conclusion 
of the Bible. And the cause to all problem is Satan. So, you 
must be able to crush Satan’s head. You must have spiritual 
eyes to see it. The cause to all problem is Satan. That is why 
God wants to crush the Satan’s head, not man’s head. You 
must possess this spiritual eyes. If not, you cannot do ‘Only.’ 
You must fight this spiritual battle. Who can win over Satan? 
What can defeat Satan? It is only Christ who will completely 
crush Satan. On that night, when they put blood on the 
doorpost, that is when all of Satan’s kingdom was completely 
burned to the ground. That is so amazing. This is what says in 
Exodus 12:12. “I will strike the firstborn in the land of Egypt, 
both man and best.” Simply imagine it. All the firstborn sons 
were put to death. Even the cows and pigs, all the beasts were 
put to death. What would have happened if this take place in 
America? They will be frantic and in uproar. And the LORD 
said, “I will execute all the gods in Egypt.” And that was 
taken place on the night. And in Gen 15:14, this is the 
prophecy what was to take place. It says, “I will come out 
with great possessions.” And is Exodus 12:36, it says, “The 
LORD had given the people favor in the sight of the 
Egyptians, so that they let them have what they asked. Thus, 
they plundered the Egyptians.” It is amazing. This is the power 
of the Gospel. This is the rightful authority of the Gospel. It 
was the blood on that night that they put. That was able to 
bind and complete the work of Satan. When they hold to the 
promising blood, that is when God is at work to overturn it 
all. And it says, even the gods of Egypt will be judged. God’s 
people will completely be set free. They are set free from 
curses and being enslaved. You must hold this as your 
covenant. Father God, at this moment, may you be able to 
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bind and put to ground all of Satan’s kingdom that attacks 
me. So that I will be used for the sake of world evangelism 
and Remnant movement. That is a prayer that holds onto the 
covenant as the Gospel. Father God, I am the church that has 
been built on the rock. You must believe in this truth. You 
must confess it every day and plant it within you during the 
time of prayer. And confess it yourself repeatedly so that it 
will be imprinted. It must become your nature. This is the only 
thing that you should do. What is anything that you to do? 
Everything is spiritual problem, and it is all the works of 
Satan. Satan is cause to all problems, that is why God has 
sent His son. If you do not possess this spiritual eye, what will 
happen to you? Then, you are not able to match with God. 
Then, what will happen? Then, you have no place. You have 
no choice but to wander elsewhere. You are not living inside 
of Christ. You must change yourself. This is only thing you to 
do because God is almighty. God can do all things. Who 
would God give all these things to? God will give it to those 
who can do this. So, do it all the time. God has given you the 
answer. This answer is the complete answer. God says, 
everything is finished with this alone. This is only thing that 
you must do. May you all be victorious by doing this alone. It 
is nothing else, but the Gospel prevails and overcome all. That 
is why there is nothing else you to do. May Christ be the 
covenant once again. Why must you enjoy the Gospel? Because 
the Gospel is the answer. 

2. 70 Workers Disciples
The second point we will look at is the ‘70 Workers Disciples.’ 
They were the disciples that were responsible of the region. 
May you make the confession before the LORD that you are 
like 70 workers. God did not just send His disciples to the 
field. In verse 3, “Go your way; behold, I am sending you out 
as lambs in the midst of wolves. That is why He has given to 
evangelist the power. And in verse 4, the LORD says, “Do not 
take anything because you are the evangelist, you do not have 
to take anything and there is no reason for you to greet even 
anyone on the road.” And in verse 5, He says, “Whenever you 
enter someone’s home, first say, ‘May God’s peace be on this 
house.” This is the authority of the evangelist. And in verse 7, 
“If anyone ask you to come inside, then do not hesitate to 
accept hospitality and eat and drink what they provide.” 
Because it is rightful the labor to deserve his wages. In God’s 
eyes, they are the greatest labors for they are the one who 
preaches the Gospel. In God’s eyes, they are the true workers. 
And the LORD says, “Do not go from house to house.” It 
means, you do not have to seek after others. You are rightfully 
receiving what you must receive. And he says, “Heal the sick.” 
There is authority inside of the Gospel that can heal all. For 
those who testify the Gospel have authority. It must be done 
by faith. And verse 10 and 11 speak about evangelists who are 
not welcomed in the region. And it says, “Even the dust of 
your town that clings to our feet we wipe off against you.” 
And “You must go and testify that the Kingdom of God has 
come near.” You must never forget God has given to you this 
outstanding authority as an evangelist. Evangelism is not you 
are begging to others. But you never be arrogant. We must be 
both humble and bold. Whatever happens, your life must be 
correlating to evangelism. It is not the simple evangelism. You 
are fighting the spiritual battle. So, you need strength and 
spiritual weapon. That is why God has given you Christ as the 
spiritual weapon. With this alone, you must be able to bind all 

the works. He has given you the authority of the power and 
He promised to send out the Heavenly army of angels. And 
He has promised filling of the Holy Spirit. May you personally 
ask yourself now. “Am I an evangelist?” How do I connect 
with God’s desire of evangelism? Because this is God’s sole 
interest. What will happen if you have no connection with 
God’s only interest? You must be the one that connect with 
God’s desire of evangelism. To be honest, we have been 
enjoying the Gospel, but we have not been connected to 
American churches. It has been 20 years, but there is not even 
a single American pastor within this Gospel movement. This is 
not an average problem. First, responsibility is all upon me. As 
I always think about Arizona, I always think of Native 
American in my heart. And in the month of June, I am 
thinking to gather those who have the heart to go to Phoenix 
so that they can have this training take place together. I 
believe that it will be a time in which the Gospel will be 
related as well. And the pastor’s wife I know is teaching 
instruments to the children in the church. She is teaching 
guitar, piano, and violin amongst the children. And I thought 
that not only just teaching instruments, but also relating the 
Gospel to the children is possible. I am upset because no one 
can leave the church right now, and we need English speaking 
ministers. We need many English-speaking ministers. We need 
many great ministers within our church especially for the sake 
of Remnants and Multi-ethnic. But if you look at perspective 
of Arizona Immanuel church, there is no single minister. When 
they look at us, we have many disciples. I believe that through 
the Indian reservation because we have never done that 
ministry, if God opens the door for us, then we will dispatch 
our minister there. And right now, in Arizona Immanuel 
church, it is within a house. They are living and worship in 
house. And I am having the thought that it will be best for us 
to purchase a new home or bigger space in which many 
Remnants will be able to go for mission trip as well. I have 
thought that I want to put that in to action after this 
pandemic concludes. I believe there is God’s plan, and we will 
be able to see the works of God. And I want you to pray for 
the pastor Ricardo and His disciple, Gabriel. We are going to 
Los Cabos, Mexico for mission trip from 12 to 18. Please pray 
for that. We are the evangelist. Then, do you possess the 
answer? Are you an evangelist that relays the answer? Can you 
leave behind the Gospel so that they can firmly hold onto it? 
Or you simply spreading the Gospel in the air? What do you 
hold to? The Gospel is clear and accurate. The sure fact is 
you must continuously hold onto and confess Christ until the 
last day of your life. In most cases, many believers have faith, 
but they have no choice but wander because they do not hold 
onto the covenant within their hands because Satan is at work. 
Then, what about the people of the world? There are no more 
other words. It should be explained. Evangelism can never 
prevail, or the Gospel cannot go to the end if the Gospel is 
not proclaimed. Because the Gospel is the answer, you must 
continuously hold onto the Gospel even if things are not 
working. When you give the Gospel as the answer to them, 
they can firmly hold to that. They all need the answer. The 
first answer is salvation. And the second answer is prayers. He 
has completed it by the precious blood on the cross. Then, 
that is the relationship between themselves and God. So may 
you confirm it and may be able to send as a witness to these 
answers. It is nothing but Gospel prevails. May it be the week 
which you can prevail with the Gospel.


